
Name:______________________________________________________

Spouse / Guest:_____________________________________________

Address:__________________________________________________________

City: __________________________ State: ___________ Zip

Code:________

Phone (Home)# ___________________ Cell# __________________________

E-mail:____________________________________________________________

Vehicle Information

Year: __________ Make: _____________________ Model:

________________

Club Name (if any, list only one):

_______________________________________________________________________

The event will occur at Flickertail Village: 405 12th Ave SE, Stanley, ND 58784
on July 4, 2021 following the parade. Check www.visitstanley.org or
www.facebook.com/stanleycommercialclub for a detailed schedule of all events.

No excessively loud exhaust systems will be allowed.

The entry fee is $30 for the 1st vehicle per registrant with additional vehicles at
$10 each. The entry fee is NOT refundable. You must be present to be eligible for
the trophies, sponsor awards or merchandise give-away.

In consideration of the acceptance of the right to participate by this form, the
exhibitor to this event will at all times comply with rules, regulations and policies
of the event producers. Neither Stanley Commercial Club, sponsors, support
personnel or anyone else connected with the presentation of this event shall be
responsible or liable for any loss, injury, judgments, claims or damage incurred
from any cause whatsoever that may be suffered by an entrant to his or her
property; further, each entrant expressly agrees to indemnify all the forgoing
entities, firms, persons and bodies of and from any and all liability occasioned or
resulting from the conduct of entrants or any participant assisting or cooperating
with entrant under the direction and control of the entrant.

http://www.visitstanley.org


Any poor behavior, irresponsible driving and/or conduct deemed objectionable to
the event’s wellbeing may result in participants being denied any further
involvement in the event and/or future events. You must drive responsibly and
obey the laws at all times.

ALL PARTICIPANTS ARE RESPONSIBLE FOR THEIR OWN PROPER
INSURANCE.

Event credentials are non-transferable without written permission of event
management. In consideration of this entry, entrants agrees to the use of their
name, photo and/or vehicle photo for publicity and/or advertising. This is a rain or
shine event.

AWARDS CATEGORIES

BEST OF SHOW * PEOPLE’S CHOICE * 1st & 2nd IN CLASS-
Cash Prizes will be awarded!

Entry Fee to an exhibitor - $30 per vehicle (1st

vehicle per registrant, $10 for each additional)
Entry Fee to spectators – Free

Registration in person: Drop off registration at Title Team 18 Railroad Ave,
Stanley, ND 58784
Registration by mail: Make Check payable to “Stanley Commercial Club” and
mail to PO BOX 974, Stanley, ND 58784. * PLEASE DO NOT MAIL AFTER
JUNE 23th, 2023.
Registration online: E-Mail completed registration form to
stanleycommercialclub@gmail.com or online at
visitstanley.org/carbike-show-form/ Drop off or mail registration fee.

Signature:_______________________________________________
Date: ____________

Official Entry Form must be signed and returned with payment enclosed. For additional
information visit www.visitstanley.org, or E-mail: stanleycommercialclub@gmail.com.

mailto:stanleycommercialclub@gmail.com

